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SR by Sonali Raman brings you Summer Sorbet, a 
new collection of kaftans and dresses that channel 
the textures, fragrances, hues and flavors of 
summers!

Soft, pure cottons made from handspun yarn and 
handwoven by a cluster based in Maheshwar, in the 
Madhya Pradesh province of India, the fabrics of 
Summer Sorbet are truly special. Stripes and checks 
come together in pop pastel hues of summer: think 
sorbets, glacés, iced lollies, granitas, frozen yogurts, 
ice creams, frappés and tall, fruity refreshing drinks.

Artfully arranged stripes and checks in shades of 
lavender blue, mint green, mango yellow and 
raspberry pink nudge each other as bright whites 
offset these delicious pop pastels to create a color 
palette that is distinctive and totally cool. 

The collection includes kaftans, long layered dresses, 
short dresses and mitered stripe dresses that are 
bias-cut and flow effortlessly to create comfortable, 
chilled-out yet chic silhouettes. Perfect for pool 
parties, picnics, a romp at the beach, travel to the 
tropics or just lounging in your garden hammock, 
these dresses come with pockets to tuck in your 
essentials: phones, tissues, and lip gloss.

Our signature chevron motifs in delicate thread-
embroidery highlight necklines and side seams, 
picked out in colors that echo the stripes and 
checks.

As always, SR by Sonali Raman works to create slow 
and mindful fashion, seeking like-minded vendors 
and collaborators. This time, our totally cool fabrics 
were woven by the talented weavers at Karghewale 
led by Nivedita, who have been trained and 
upskilled by the Handloom School in Maheshwar.
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Faloodeh
Available in checks and stripes: Free size 



Gelato
Available in checks and stripes: S-M & L-XL



Kulf i
Available in checks and stripes: S-M & L-XL



Granitas
Available in checks and stripes: Free size 



Glace
Available in stripes: S-M & L-XL





Froyo
Mix of checks and stripes: S-M & L-XL



Sherbet
Available in stripes: Free size
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